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The argument put forward by Extract A is that Eisenhower was a levelheaded 
president who “remained calm” and skillfully maintained peace throughout his time 
in office. The extract also suggests that Eisenhower was a shrewd and confident 
leader, not an “intellectual lightweight” as first thought. Herring explains that the 
reputation of Eisenhower as a golf playing part-time politician has been removed, 
and revisionists now see his personal experiences as Supreme Allied Commander 
during World War Two has allowed him to have many strengths for his role in the 
White House. This is quite a convincing argument. The extract also rightly 
comments on Eisenhower keeping the peace and avoiding direct confrontation 
during his time, despite potential hotspots in Berlin, the Middle East, Far East and 
even Cuba.  
 
Although the extract suggests that Eisenhower avoided “open-ended military 
commitments” this argument could be challenged. At the end of the 1950s the USA 
was in discussions with Macmillan’s Britain about the positioning of Polaris 
submarines in Holyloch, Scotland. By 1961 the first was stationed and the arms race 
went in yet another direction for many years to come. There was also the secret air 
war, a vast espionage effort pushed by the military, against the Soviet Union and 
China. U2 spy plane missions escalated and even resulted in Gary Powers being shot 
down in 1960. Furthermore involvement in Cuba after Castro’s takeover in 1959 led 
to Ike’s part with the CIA in planning Operation Mongoose and the future Bay of Pigs 
invasion that was carried out under Kennedy’s watch. Then there as the USA’s role in 
Vietnam from 1954 after the French defeat at Dien Bien Phu, this military 
involvement was to last to 1973 and clearly shows a flaw in Herring’s argument. 
 
However the argument in Extract A that Eisenhower “kept the military budget 
under some semblance of control” does have credibility as despite inheriting a large 
budget from Truman, Ike reduced it considerably and then more or less maintained 
the budget at the same level throughout his 8 years in office. This supports Herring’s 
overall view that Eisenhower deserves some praise for remaining calm and collected 
during a period of Cold War confrontations and escalation of the arms and space 
races. 

 
NOW YOUR TURN FOR EXTRACTS B AND C !!! 
 
Extract B offers the argument that Eisenhower was successful at maintaining 
‘tranquility’ and ‘steadfastly confronting’ communism during a period of high tension 
between world powers. This extract is complementary of Eisenhower in his efforts 
to not resort to ‘global confrontation’ citing the Korean War, Berlin and Vietnam 
where the Cold War could have developed into a hot war. The extract also suggests 
that Eisenhower was successful in dealing with the threat of ‘Soviet communism’, 
which is supported by the Geneva and Paris summits and Eisenhower’s roll back 
policy. Therefore this is quite a convincing argument. 



However, although the extract implies that one of Eisenhower’s greatest 
achievements was ‘to have access to atomic weapons and not use them’ tis view 
could be challenged and underpinned as an exaggeration. While it is true that 
Eisenhower did face pressure from hawks to utilize America’s nuclear power, it was 
only Truman who had ever had access to it, and used, nuclear weapons; immediately 
regretting it and being condemned by many for this decision. Moreover the 
argument that he ‘nurtured’ the peace in Europe can be seen as invalid as he 
refused to intervene in Hungary, due to upcoming elections, despite encouraging the 
uprising and also in the Paris talks he refused to apologise following the USSR’s 
shooting down of the U2 spy plane. This clearly shows a flaw in Newton’s argument 
and this makes the extract less convincing. 
 
Extract C alternatively suggests the Eisenhower was largely unsuccessful and that 
his ‘single’ achievement was that he kept the country at peace. Graubard takes a 
negative view of Eisenhower claiming that he ‘neglected’, ‘pretended’ and ‘failed 
utterly’ in his policies. It is true that to a large extent Eisenhower ignored the 
opportunities offered with destalinization and the thaw in the Cold War, opting 
instead to play golf. The argument that he ‘ never understood’ Europe is convincing 
as shown in the failure of his roll back policy and his inaction in the Hungarian 
uprising. 

 



 
 

 


